
March 1, 2021 

Dear Sir or Madam: 

 I am seeking the judgeship in Municipal Court, Division I, vacated by the death of Judge Teresa 
Jones; attached you will find my resume. 

My qualifications in public service include my current position as the administrator of the Shelby 
County Office of Equal Opportunity Compliance; seven years as an assistant public defender for 
the Shelby County Public Defenders Office, along with my extensive pro bono work in the 
criminal courts.  My 20-plus years as a public servant provides a direct link to the kind of 
responsibilities outlined in the position. 

When I was thrust into a single parent role, life, as I knew it, changed forever when my older 
sister, a single parent, died of a stroke in November, 1994, leaving her two young children, Kris, 
age 14 and Brandon, age 12.  My older brother and I reared them. Kris, my niece, came to live 
with me and Brandon, my nephew, went to live with my older brother.  But before my sister 
died, life was good.  At age 34, I loved working in the Public Defenders Office. Though the work 
was challenging, it was what I knew was my calling.  

The devastating blow of my sister’s death was a wake-up call for me. Through the years of 
having to become a parent and raise a family, I have learned many life lessons.  But what is 
paramount to me is that a life of service, in whatever capacity, is a life of many rewards. .   As a 
judge for the Municipal Courts, I will bring the experience, the drive, the sheer will and sense of 
fairness needed to be the best that I can be no matter what the situation.  

 When a judge is fair, yet compassionate, it improves the public perception of the judge and the 
judicial system.   Citizens want to be treated fairly and with respect, whether it’s for a traffic 
ticket or for a loose dog.  As a lawyer, I have a fierce sense of justice. And, I know I wield a kind 
of power that can be used to help those who have none.  

Being a public servant is what motivates me. I have also worked in many service oriented roles, 
including mentoring young women and working diligently in the community. And, I fully 
understand the rigors of the legal profession. 

I have a long-standing proven record and can provide excellent references, who can corroborate 
my claims. I believe my experience as a lawyer, public servant and mentor can be useful in 
maintaining, quality control and cost-effective results. 

I look forward to discussing the matter with you further.  If you have any questions or comments, 
please call me at (901) 494-2965 or by email at cwatkins48@gmail.com. 
. 
Respectfully yours, 

Attorney Carolyn Watkins 

mailto:cwatkins48@gmail.com


CAROLYN S. WATKINS 

_____________________________________________________________________________________ 

Career Objective:  Seeking the judgeship in Municipal Court, Division I in which my 20-plus 
years of experience as an attorney, administrator, mentor and public servant can be utilized. 

RELEVANT     Administrator          Attorney       Adjunct Professor       Law Clerk 

EXPERIENCE  Record Keeping     Workshop Facilitator       Consultant       Hearing Officer  

 Peer Counselor  Research Assistant 

Summary of Qualifications  

Work experience 

1994 to present   Shelby County Office of Equal Opportunity Compliance, Administrator 

!987 to 1994 Shelby County Defenders Office, Assistant Public Defender.  

2003 to 2005 LeMoyne-Owen College: Adjunct Professor.  Taught Human Resources 
Management 

2004 to 2005  LeMoyne: Taught Employment Law 

1990 to 1993 University of Memphis: Adjunct Professor; taught Criminal Investigations 

Education 

Loyola University School of Law, New Orleans, Louisiana, Juris Doctorate Law Degree, 1986 

Jackson State University, Jackson, Mississippi, Bachelor’s Degree, Political Science, 1982 

Computer skills: Microsoft Word, Excel, Outlook and Powerpoint. 

Volunteerism/Memberships/Achievements 

National Bar Association, Presidential Award given by then President Benjamin Crump, 
outstanding community service, 2016. 

References 

References will be submitted upon request. 
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RESOLUTION 

WHEREAS, in June of 2020, the Memphis City Council passed a Resolution requesting 

the administration establish June 19th as “Juneteenth Independence Day” within the City of 

Memphis recognizing the liberation and emancipation of enslaved African-Americans in the 

United States of America; and 

WHEREAS, the Mayor and administration support recognizing the significance of the 

historical day to Memphis and our nation as a renewed opportunity to learn more about the 

past and to better understand the need for an improved future; and  

WHEREAS, there are currently thirteen (13) holidays as part of the City of Memphis 

benefit package on which employees receive a paid day of leave, many divisions of city 

government are closed, and citizens are not served; this number of 13 paid holidays exceeds most 

every public and private organization; in addition, the City offers an extraordinarily generous 

amount of paid time off – vacation (up to 25 days per year), 13 holidays, and sick leave (accrued 

up to 30 days per year); and  

 WHEREAS, many City divisions services, including Police and Fire, are necessary 24 hours 

a day, 7 days a week and cannot cease operations on holidays; the cost of holiday pay for each 

City of Memphis paid holiday is approximately $1 million; paid holidays essentially cost Memphis 

taxpayers more money; and 

 WHEREAS, the administration will add a Juneteenth Independence Day paid holiday for 

City of Memphis employees on or around June 19th each year, however the February Presidents 

Day holiday will cease to be a paid holiday.   

 NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that beginning FY 2022, the City of Memphis 

employee paid holiday schedule will be revised to delete Presidents Day in February and add 

Juneteenth Independence Day in June. 

































































































































































































































































































































































































































































City Council Item Routing Sheet 

Division__________________  Committee   ______________  Hearing Date _________________ 

___ 

☐Budget Amendment ☐Commendation

Item Description : 

Status of MWBE planned expenditures funding, if applicable:

Describe previous action taken by any other entity (i.e. board, commission, task force, council committee, etc.) 
and date of any action taken:       

Does this item require city expenditure? No 

$     Amount_______________ 

$     Revenue to be received________________ 

Source and Amount of Funds 

$     Operating Budget 

$     CIP Project #     

$     Federal/State/Other 

Approvals

Director______________________________Date_______ 

Budget Manager ______________________Date________ 

Chief Financial Officer___________________Date________ 

Deputy Financial Officer_________________Date________ 

Chief Legal Officer_____________________ Date________ 

☐ Ordinance

Chief Administrative Officer 

______________________________Date_________ 

Council Committee Chair 

______________________________Date_________ 

☐Resolution ☐Grant Acceptance

☐Other:

Recommended Council Action: 

Division__________________  Committee   ______________ 

District__________________  Super District   ______________ 



Memphis City Council Summary Sheet 

1. Description of the Item (Resolution, Ordinance, etc.)

2. Initiating Party (e.g. Public Works, at request of City Council, etc.)

3. State whether this is a change to an existing ordinance or resolution, if

applicable.

4. State whether this will impact specific council districts or super

districts.

5. State whether this requires a new contract, or amends an existing contract,

if applicable.

6. State whether this requires an expenditure of funds/requires a budget amendment

7. If applicable, please list the MWBE goal and any additional information needed



AN ORDINANCE TO ESTABLISH THE LOCAL SALES TAX REFERENDUM FUND, A 

SPECIAL REVENUE FUND 

WHEREAS, the Memphis Police Association and the Memphis Fire Fighters 
Association sponsored a campaign to petition for a sales tax measure to increase the City 
of Memphis’ local sales and use tax by 0.50% to a tax rate of 2.75% (“Local Sales Tax 
Referendum”);  

WHEREAS, the initiative petition for a sales tax was conducted pursuant to Tenn. 
Code Ann. § 67-6-707, which authorizes a citizen signature petition to initiate a sales tax 
measure in a county or municipality;  

WHEREAS, the Local Sales Tax Referendum specifically outlined the intended 
uses for the proceeds of the tax rate increase.  Those designated uses were stated as 
follows: 

The proceeds of this 0.5% tax increase shall first be used to 
restore and maintain the health care benefits for Public Safety 
employees (employees and pre-65 retirees of the Memphis 
Police Services and Fire Services Divisions) to the levels in 
effect as of July 1, 2014, and to restore and maintain the 
pension benefits of said employees hired prior to July 1, 2016 
to the levels specified in the 1978 City of Memphis Pension 
Plan. Any remaining proceeds shall be used for street 
maintenance and/or pre-kindergarten education. All funds 
must be spent for the purposes designated above. These 
funds are to be used in addition to, and may not be used to 
replace or supplant, any current funding for the above 
purposes 

WHEREAS, the Local Sales Tax Referendum was placed on the ballot for election 
on October 3, 2019; 

WHEREAS, on October 3, 2019, voters in the City of Memphis voted to approve 
the Local Sales Tax Referendum to increase the local sales tax rate to 2.75%;   

WHEREAS, the effective date of the tax rate increase was January 1, 2020; and 

WHEREAS, the Memphis City Council desire to establish a special revenue fund 
to deposit the proceeds of the sales tax increase to ensure that such funds are used for  
purposes consistent with the will of the majority of voters and pursuant to Tennessee 
Code § 67-6-702. 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MEMPHIS, TENNESSEE as follows: 

SECTION 1: That a new chapter shall be added to Title 5, Chapter 5 entitled “Local Sales 
Tax Referendum Fund” which shall provide as follows: 



Title 5, Chapter 5, Section 41 

A. Creation of Fund.  The Local Tax Referendum Fund is hereby established to 
capture and segregate the additional .5% sales tax revenue that represents the 
increase in the local options sales tax per the Local Sales Tax Referendum passed 
on October 3, 2019, effective January 1, 2020.   
 

B. Source of Funds.  The Local Sales Tax Referendum Fund shall consist of solely 
proceeds from the 0.50% sales and use tax increase received from the Tennessee 
Department of Revenue.   
 

C. Use of Funds.  All funds in the Local Sales Tax Referendum Fund shall be used 
solely for the following purposes: 
 

1. Required, recurring, annual expenses to restore and maintain the health 
care benefits for employees and pre-65 retirees of the Memphis Police 
Services and Fire Services Divisions to the levels in effect as of July 1, 2014; 
 

2. Required, recurring, annual expenses to restore and maintain the pension 
benefits of employees of the Memphis Police Services and Fire Services 
Divisions hired prior to July 1, 2016 to the levels specified in the 1978 City 
of Memphis Pension Plan, in accordance with Substitute Ordinance No. 
5763; 

 
3. Required annual reserve for related OBEP contributions and costs, per the 

schedule as determined by the State of Tennessee; and   
 

4. Public-safety based programming and activities; paving; and to support pre-
kindergarten education. 

 
D. Fund Requirements and Conditions. 

 
1. The funds in the Local Sales Tax Referendum Fund may not be used to 

replace or supplant any current funding for the purposes set forth herein. 
 

2. In any year that the proceeds received from the subject 0.50% sales and 
use tax increase is insufficient to pay the annual costs of the pension and 
health benefits, including related costs, as stated in the Local Sales Tax 
Referendum, then benefits for subject employees shall be reduced until 
such time that the proceeds in the Local Sales Tax Referendum Fund 
becomes sufficient to pay such costs.  Such reduction in benefit shall be to 
the level of benefits that the annual costs thereof may be paid in full the year 
that funds are available. 

 



3. In any year that the proceeds received from the subject 0.50% sales and 
use tax increase is insufficient to pay for programs funded by the Local 
Sales Tax Referendum Fund other than the cost of healthcare benefits, 
pension, and the related OPEB reserves, then expenditures for such 
programs may be reduced or eliminated. 

 
4. The Local Sales Tax Referendum Fund is a non-recurring fund. Except as 

specifically delineated herein, the funds shall not be used for any recurring, 
permanent obligations, such as wage or salary increases. 

 
5. The Fund will separately record the expenses and expenditures.  Pursuant 

to Tennessee Code Ann. § 9-21-403, the City’s annual budget submission 
to the Comptroller’s Division of Local Government should include fund 
balance and cash management policies for the Local Sales Tax 
Referendum Fund, and expenditures shall be classified as recurring or 
nonrecurring.   

 
6. The Local Sales Tax Referendum Fund shall be administered in compliance 

with all applicable state and local authority, policies and procedures. 

 

SECTION 2. BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that the provisions of this Ordinance are 
hereby severable. If any of these sections, provisions, sentences, clauses, phrases, or 
parts is held unconstitutional or void, the remainder of this Ordinance shall continue in full 
force and effect. 

SECTION 3. BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that this Ordinance shall take effect from and 
after the date, it shall have been passed by the Council, signed by the Chairperson of the 
Council, certified and delivered to the Office of the Mayor in writing by the Comptroller 
and become effective as otherwise provided by law. 

 

Sponsor 
Administration 



 

 

 
 
 
 

RESOLUTION 
 
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Light, Gas and Water Commissioners in their meeting of 

September 16, 2020 awarded Contract No. 12218,  Power Supply Consultant to GDS Associates, 

Inc. in the funded not-to-exceed amount of $520,000.00, and is now recommending to the Council of 

the City of Memphis that it approves said award as proposed; and 

WHEREAS, the project scope is to provide consulting services required for MLGW to 

solicit requests for proposals for the procurement of electric capacity, energy, transmission, 

renewable energy (e.g. solar and wind), ancillary services and to assist MLGW in the evaluation of 

responses to portfolios identified in the Integrated Resource Plan (IRP) and feasible alternatives. 

WHEREAS, MLGW solicited 11 and received five (5) proposals on September 4, 2020. 

The three (3) highest scored firms were selected for presentations, with the most responsive 

proposal from GDS Associates, Inc. in the amount of $492,500.00. MLGW is also requesting 

$27,500.00 for travel contingencies. The total funded amount of this award is not-to-exceed 

$520,000.00. The term of this contract is for 24 months from the date of the Notice to Proceed with 

annual renewal options. This award complies with all applicable laws and policies; and· 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Council of the City of  Memphis, that 

there be and is hereby approved an award of Contract No. 12218, Power Supply Consultant to GDS 

Associates, Inc. in the funded not-to-exceed amount of $520,000.00 as approved. 

THEREFORE, BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED BY THE Memphis City Council that the 

additional requirements be included in the agreement with GDS Associates and agreed upon by the 

MLGW Board of Commissioners. 

1. The City of Memphis Administration should review and approve the RFPs before they are 
issued and the City of Memphis Administration shall be a part of the review and selection 
process of any RFP submissions. 



 

 

2. The RFPs should make it clear that the 3 Portfolios are the desired scenarios, but that any 
response may include additional proposals of a better way to transmit or generate power for 
Memphis and Shelby County.  

3. Use the “EPC/PPA Term Sheet and Final Offer” stage as a check-in for the MLGW Board of 
Commissioners and Memphis City Council to determine the feasibility of leaving Tennessee 
Valley Authority within 7 -11 months of the issuance of Notice to Proceed.  

4. During the “Bid Evaluation and Short List” process, there must be an evaluation of the 
reliability of the power supplier, transmission and generation, including such things like 
evaluating economics, risk analysis, counterparty creditworthiness, counterparty market 
credibility, past performance, etc. 

 
Frank Colvett, Jr.  
Chairman 

 
Sponsor: 
Cheyenne Johnson 

 

 



















 
Resolution requesting that the City of Memphis Solid Waste Division issue a credit for one 
month of Solid Waste fees for all customers residing in Area E 

 
 

WHEREAS, Chapter 15, Section 15-12 of the Memphis Code of Ordinances mandates 
the solid waste fee for all City of Memphis serviced residences; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Memphis City Council has received and responded to calls and reports 
concerning Waste Pro’s failure to collect solid waste, curbside items and recyclables in parts of 
Cordova, Hickory Hill, and East Memphis (collectively known as “Solid Waste Area E”) for the 
past month; and  

 

WHEREAS, within the last month, Solid Waste Area E residents have logged thousands 
of missed collection complaints with the Mayor’s Action Center; and 

 

WHEREAS, the City of Memphis Administration is currently reviewing the concerns 
regarding the egregious nature of services provided and ways to improve the customer 
experience with solid waste collection; and  

 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, as a measure of good faith within the 
residents of Solid Waste Area E, the Memphis City Council request a one-month credit be given 
to all of those residing in Solid Waste Area E affected by the lack of adequate solid waste 
services. 

         Frank Colvett, Chairman 
 
Sponsors:  Frank Colvett 
  Rhonda Logan 
  Patrice Robinson  



Resolution requesting an independent audit and investigation of the Waste Pro Contract 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Memphis is responsible for providing adequate solid waste 
services to all citizens of Memphis; and 
 

WHEREAS, solid waste collection is a basic, humane service that citizens have a right to 
expect from the City of Memphis; and  
 

WHEREAS, after having service delivery issues with a former provider, the City of 
Memphis entered into a contract with Waste Pro of Tennessee, Inc. (“Waste Pro”) on July 1, 
2019 for Waste Pro to fulfil the City of Memphis’ obligation to collect household garbage, 
recycling, yard waste and bulk items for the residents in Solid Waste Area E (“Area E”), which 
include Cordova, Hickory Hill and East Memphis; and 
 

WHEREAS, within the first year of the service contract between the City of Memphis and 
Waste Pro, the 37,000 residents within Area E began to once again experience collection issues; 
and 
 

WHEREAS, the inadequate service provided to residents prompted the City of Memphis 
to begin reviewing the contract with Waste Pro in search of a remedy to the issue; and 
 

WHEREAS, since June 2020, the City of Memphis has issued two (2) notices to cure, 
added a City of Memphis liaison, and added 10 Route validators, 10 new crews, 13 new rear 
loaders, a new supervisor and new operations manager for Waste Pro; and  
 

WHEREAS, since then, Area E residents have continued to experience a high level of 
service disruption; and  
 

WHEREAS, it is the goal of the Memphis City Council to determine why the residents of 
Cordova, Hickory Hill and parts of East Memphis continue to experience service issues with 
contractor provided collected. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Memphis City Council request the City of 
Memphis Administration to perform an independent audit and investigation into the Waste Pro 
contract to determine the justification for financial investments made to supplement the Waste 
Pro Contract and factors behind the continued failure of Waste Pro’s service to Area E. 

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City of Memphis Administration report to the City 

Council any and all findings of the audit and investigation. 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Administration provide the Memphis City 

Council a plan to effectively service Area E using City of Memphis Solid Waste employees.  
 
 
Sponsor: Councilwoman Rhonda Logan 

Frank Colvett, Chairman 

















  

 

Memphis City Council Summary Sheet 

 

1. Description of the Item (Resolution, Ordinance, etc.) 

This is a Resolution requesting the approval for the sale of City owned surplus property located at 

0 Oakview Street in Memphis, Shelby County, Tennessee and further described as Parcel ID # 

031031 00011. 

 

2. Initiating Party (e.g. Public Works, at request of City Council, etc.) 

General Services 

 

3. State whether this is a change to an existing ordinance or resolution, if applicable. 

This item does not require  a change to an existing ordinance. 

 

4. State whether this requires a new contract, or amends an existing contract, if 

applicable. 

This item does not require a new contract or amend an existing contract. 

 

5. State whether this requires an expenditure of funds/requires a budget amendment. 

This item does not require an expenditure of funds or a budget amendment. 

 



               City Council Resolution   

1 
 

   

 

A Resolution requesting approval for the sale of a city owned parcel known as  
0 Oakview, Parcel ID #031031 00011 Memphis, Tennessee 38114 
 

 
WHEREAS, City of Memphis owns a surplus parcel located at 0 Oakview, which has a value 

less than $10,000, (“The Parcel”) that was acquired by Warranty Deed, Instrument #V48019 

recorded in the Shelby County Register’s Office and is further identified by Shelby County Tax 

Assessor as Parcel #031031 00011 containing 0.251 acres;   

WHEREAS, the sale of the subject Parcel will increase the City’s General Fund, and eliminate 

blight and maintenance cost for the City of Memphis;  

WHEREAS, Dream Team Solutions, LLC submitted an offer of Six Thousand Five Hundred 

Dollars ($6,500.00) along with a Six Hundred Fifty Dollars ($650.00) Earnest Money deposit to the 

City of Memphis Real Estate Center; and  

WHEREAS, is it deemed to be in the best interest of the Citizens of the City of Memphis and 

County of Shelby that said sale be accepted subject to City Ordinance 5637, Amendment to 

Section 2-291(A) of the City’s Code of ordinance. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Memphis that the offer 

made by Dream Team Solutions, LLC, on the above described Parcel is hereby accepted subject 

to the City Ordinance 5637, Amendment to Chapter 2, Article V, Division 2, Section 1, Section 2-

291(A)1 which states in part, “properties receiving an initial bid offer of twenty thousand dollars 

($20,000) or less shall be submitted for approval to the City Council for first reading, which is 

final.” 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that subject to the Ordinance, the City of Memphis Real Estate 

Department shall prepare and arrange for the execution of the quit claim deed, and any other 

documents incidental to the completion of the transfer, and the Mayor of the City of Memphis is 

hereby authorized to execute said deeds or any other documents necessary to complete the sale 

and conveyance. 



RESOLUTION TO ACKNOWLEDGE AND ESTABLISH COMMUNITIES THAT ARE IN IMMEDIATE NEED OF 

BEAUTIFICATION AND BLIGHT REMEDIATION 

WHEREAS, we acknowledge that Memphis has struggled in recent years with blighted 

properties and illegal dumping, which contributes to a decrease in property values, unsanitary 

conditions, and undesirable eyesores for the entire community; and 

WHEREAS, we hear legitimate concerns voiced by residents in the North Memphis, South 

Memphis, and Whitehaven communities and recognize that the significant illegal dumping in these 

areas contributes to habitual blight, and  

WHEREAS, the City Council wishes to acknowledge the hard work and dedication to addressing 

these issues by Steve Shular on behalf of the Mayor’s Office and coordinated efforts with Memphis Code 

Enforcement, Memphis Public Service Corps, Memphis City Beautiful, Division of Solid Waste, and Clean 

Memphis; and 

WHEREAS, Memphis once was the winner of the “Nation’s Cleanest City” award four years in a 

row and the City Council wishes to return to our past prominence; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council wants to increase beautification efforts aimed at cleaning these 

communities.  

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Memphis City Council does hereby seek to increase the 

beautification and blight remediation efforts in North Memphis, South Memphis, and Whitehaven in 

collaboration with community partners and residents, with the recognition that this list of communities 

is not exhaustive and that other neighborhoods will be added at a later date. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Memphis City Council does hereby request that street 

sweepers and community groups charged with beautifying neighborhoods operate at an increased 

capacity in the areas of North Memphis, South Memphis, and Whitehaven to help further reduce litter 

and blight. 

 

Sponsor: 

JB Smiley, Jr. 







WHEREAS, when worthy circumstances arise, the Memphis City Council has seen fit to name certain public roads to 
honor citizens who have served this community; and 

 
WHEREAS, Mr. LaVaughn Bridges and his legacy of achievement represent one of these worthy circumstances; and 

 
WHEREAS, Mr. Bridges was raised in South Memphis by his grandmother and graduated from Hamilton High School; 
and 

 
WHEREAS, upon graduating from Hamilton High School, Mr. Bridges subsequently matriculated to the illustrious 
Alabama State University, where he earned a Bachelor of Science degree; and 
 
WHEREAS, a firm believer in the power of education as a tool for personal, as well as community empowerment, Mr. 
Bridges continued his professional training at the University of Memphis, where he earned a Master of Science degree; and 

 
WHEREAS, guided by his life’s purpose to inspire, empower, and educate, Mr. Bridges put his skills to use as an 
elementary school teacher within the Memphis City Schools System, a path that ultimately guided him into public school 
administration; and  

 
WHEREAS, in doing so, Mr. Bridges began his administrative tenure as the Assistant Principal of Melrose High School, 
serving under then Principal Melvin Conley; and 

 
WHEREAS, subsequently, Mr. Bridges rose to the level of high school principal in 1979, serving as his beloved Melrose 
High School’s Principal for nearly thirty years; and 

 
WHEREAS, as Melrose High School’s leader, Mr. Bridges truly found his life’s calling, serving as a mentor for multiple 
generations of students, teachers, and community residents alike; and  

 
WHEREAS, as a result, it is no surprise that Mr. Bridges received a plethora of honors for his visionary guidance, both 
for Melrose High School and Orange Mound; his lasting work continues to inspire confidence within the neighborhood and 
its residents to the present-day; and 

 
WHEREAS, after more than a quarter of a century as the Wildcats’ fearless leader, Mr. Bridges retired from his 
principalship, and yet, remained close to education as a consultant for the W.E.B. DuBois Consortium of Schools; and  

 
WHEREAS, although Mr. Bridges always found immense fulfillment in being a lifelong professional educator, his most 
prized roles will always be that of father, husband, brother, and friend; Mr. Bridges’ marriage to the late-Mrs. Shirley 
Bridges produced two wonderful sons – LaVaughn and Orlando – and most recently, one granddaughter, Madison; and  

 
WHEREAS, it is truly the sum of all of these attributes and qualities that make Mr. Bridges an invaluable member of the 
Memphis community. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that Haynes Street between Barron Avenue and Park Avenue be declared 

     “LaVaughn Bridges Street” 
 
in honor of his exemplary contributions to the City of Memphis. 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Engineer is requested to affix suitable signs designating this public road. 

 
Adopted: April 6, 2021 

 
   Sponsor: 

Vice Chairwoman Jamita Swearengen 
Memphis City Council 

District 4 



 
WHEREAS, on occasion the Memphis City Council has seen fit to name certain public roads to 

honor citizens who have inspired this community; and 
 

WHEREAS, Mr. Andrew M. Love, as one half of the Memphis Horns, is one such citizen whose 
contributions to the City of Memphis are worthy of recognition; and 

 
WHEREAS, born on November 21, 1941 to a Baptist preacher and loving mother, Mr. Love 

fostered his ability and love of the saxophone within his father’s church; and 
 
WHEREAS, with a desire to further his musical education, Mr. Love studied music at Langston 

University in Oklahoma before returning to Memphis in 1965; and 
 
WHEREAS, upon his return to Memphis, Mr. Love teamed up with trumpet player Wayne 

Jackson and began session work at Stax Records, creating Stax’s signature horn sound; and 
 
WHEREAS, after recording on numerous tracks at Stax Records, Mr. Love and Wayne Jackson 

incorporated themselves into “The Memphis Horns” and began freelancing; and 
 
WHEREAS, Mr. Love used his talents on many records for artists, such as Otis Redding, Sam & 

Dave, Neil Diamond, Elvis Presley, and Dusty Springfield; he also toured with many artists, including The 
Doobie Brothers, Jimmy Buffett and Robert Cray; and 

 
WHEREAS, although Mr. Love received many awards and honors throughout his lifetime, 

including induction into the Memphis Music Hall of Fame and a Grammy Lifetime Achievement Award in 
2012, it was Mr. Love’s ability to penetrate your soul and arouse your deepest emotions with his music 
that family, friends, and fans will remember. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MEMPHIS CITY COUNCIL OF MEMPHIS, TENNESSEE 

that Brakebill Cove in Memphis, Tennessee be designated as  
 

“Andrew Love Cove” 
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Engineer is requested to affix suitable signs so 
designated such public road. 

 
ADOPTED: April 6, 2021 

 

  _______________________ 

       Patrice J. Robinson    
       Councilmember 
 
 
       _______________________ 
       Frank Colvett, Jr. 
       Chairman 
 



WHEREAS, when worthy circumstances arise, the Memphis City Council has seen fit to name certain public roads to 
honor citizens who have served this community; and 

 
WHEREAS, the late-Mrs. Patricia Merrill and her legacy of excellence represent one of these worthy 

circumstances; and 
 
WHEREAS, Mrs. Merrill was born to the late-Ralph and Marjorie Bursiek in Belvidere, Illinois on October 11, 

1928; and 
 
WHEREAS, upon graduating from the University of Cincinnati – where she was inducted into the Phi Beta Kappa 

honor society – Mrs. Merrill was commissioned an Ensign in the United States Navy Waves where she served her country 
as a Communications Officer; and 

 
WHEREAS, after travelling the world, living in Bermuda, California, Virginia, and Illinois, Mrs. Merrill made 

Memphis her home and put her invaluable life experiences to use within her local community; and 
 
WHEREAS, a relentless advocate for the City of Memphis, Mrs. Merrill dedicated herself to pursuits that 

maximized our potential for the benefit of all; and  
 
WHEREAS, in doing so, Mrs. Merrill took on many roles, notably as Chairwoman of the Memphis City Beautiful 

Commission; Co-founder of the Chickasaw Bluff Conservancy; Founder and First President of the Sea Isle Park 
Neighborhood Association, which is the second oldest neighborhood association within the City of Memphis, active for 
over 40 years; Alumna of Leadership Memphis Class of 1985; and Member of Colonial Park United Methodist Church; and  

 
WHEREAS, always driven to (1) see the potential in a place, and then (2) bring that potential to fruition, Mrs. 

Merrill was the driving force responsible for the creation of the Mississippi Riverbluff Walkway, which makes the 
Mississippi River and its beautiful environs accessible to all Memphians, connecting Harbor Town to French Fort and 
Downtown Memphis in between; and 

 
WHEREAS, Mrs. Merrill deservedly received numerous awards throughout her life, including the Memphis City 

Council’s 1988 “Outstanding Community Contributions” award; the Memphis Flyer’s 2002 Women of Achievement award; 
and being honored as the namesake of the Sea Isle Park Arboretum; she will be most remembered for the manner in which 
she selflessly served her fellow citizens as a courageous visionary who achieved countless successes for the City of Memphis 
due to her willingness to fight for causes in which she deeply believed; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Memphis City Council finds value in honoring Memphians whose efforts reflect our community’s 

best qualities, we now endeavor to establish an honorary public road designation to entreat citizens everywhere to emulate 
Mrs. Patricia Merrill’s tenacity and dedication to forward progress within their daily lives. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that Sea Isle Road between Estate Drive and South White Station Road 

be declared 
 

            “Patricia Merrill Place” 
 
in honor of her life and positive contributions to the City of Memphis. 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Engineer is requested to affix suitable signs designating this public 
road. 

 
Adopted: April 6, 2021 

 
 
 

_____________________________ 
FRANK COLVETT, JR. 

Chairman, Memphis City Council 
District 2 



RESOLUTION TO CREATE THE MEMPHIS ACADEMY OF CIVIC ENGAGEMENT 

WHEREAS, the Memphis City Council finds it important for citizens to be informed and engaged 

and for the City of Memphis to maintain transparency; and 

WHEREAS, the citizens of Memphis have consistently sought information and insight regarding 

government affairs; and 

WHEREAS, it is the will of the body to create a program that not only informs but involves the 

people in the affairs of the City of Memphis; and 

WHEREAS, the creation of the Memphis Academy of Civic Engagement would meet this need by 

providing information and transparency to citizens interested in learning more through a structured 

curriculum designed to educate participants on various sectors of local government; and 

WHEREAS, the Memphis Academy of Civic Engagement’s call to action is “Get Involved, Mane!” 

and seeks to engage citizens from all areas of the city. 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Memphis City Council does hereby create and implement 

the Memphis Academy of Civic Engagement as outlined in this resolution. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the Memphis City Council requests that funding in the amount of 

$50,000 be included within the Council’s Community Impact Fund for Fiscal Year 2022.  

Program Description 

The Memphis Academy of Civic Engagement is a 7-week course that will educate citizens on various 

sectors of local government. The program will feature weekly 2-hour meetings covering different topics. 

Presenters will include leaders in various departments of city government. The program will begin with 2 

fall cohorts and 2 winter cohorts. Each cohort will have 30 participants. The topics included in the 

program curriculum include: infrastructure, neighborhood revitalization, workforce development, and 

youth, public safety, budgeting, overview of legislative and executive branches of city government, 

MLGW, and serving Memphis.  

Application and Selection Process 

There will be an online application available on the City of Memphis website. Citizens ages 18 and over 

are eligible to participate in the program. Applications will open on July 15, 2021 and close on August 15, 

2021. Participants will be notified by September 1, 2021 of their selection for a cohort. The program 

start dates for the fall and winter cohorts are TBD. A graduation ceremony will take place at the 

conclusion of the program.  

Governance 

At a later date, we will bring before this body the 5-member Board of Admissions, who will review the 

applications and select the cohort participants and the Dean, who will be in charge of facilitating the 

program.  
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